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DK Great DK is a notorious character in the Super Smash Bros.
community. It is a modified version of the regular Donkey Kong character
that was banned from official tournaments due to its overpowered moveset
and glitches. This article aims to provide a comprehensive history of DK
Great DK, from its origins to its impact on the Smash community.

Origins

DK Great DK was created by a modder known as "DJKrazyKong" in 2001.
DJKrazyKong wanted to create a more powerful version of Donkey Kong,
and he did so by modifying the character's code to give him increased
strength, speed, and recovery abilities. He also added a number of new
glitches to the character, such as the ability to infinite chain grab
opponents.

Gameplay

DK Great DK quickly became popular among Smash Bros. players due to
its overpowered moveset. The character had incredibly strong attacks,
including a forward smash that could KO opponents at ridiculously low
percentages. It also had a number of powerful glitches, such as the ability
to perform an infinite chain grab and a glitch that allowed it to recover from
virtually any situation.
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Controversies

DK Great DK's overpowered gameplay quickly led to controversy within the
Smash Bros. community. Many players felt that the character was unfair
and that it gave an unfair advantage to those who used it. This led to the
character being banned from most official tournaments, including those
organized by Nintendo.

Impact on the Smash Community

Despite being banned from official tournaments, DK Great DK continued to
be popular among Smash Bros. players. It was frequently used in unranked
matches and in online tournaments. The character's popularity led to the
creation of a number of sub-communities dedicated to playing and
discussing DK Great DK.

Legacy

DK Great DK remains a controversial figure in the Smash Bros. community.
Some players view it as a fun and overpowered character that adds variety
to the game, while others believe that it is an unfair and broken character
that should never have been created. Regardless of one's opinion on the
character, there is no doubt that DK Great DK has had a lasting impact on
the Smash Bros. community.

DK Great DK is a unique and controversial character in the Super Smash
Bros. series. It is a testament to the game's modding community and its
ability to create characters that can challenge the game's established meta.
While DK Great DK may never be allowed in official tournaments, it will
continue to be a popular character among Smash Bros. players for years to
come.
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